
RESOLUTION 2024-002 

VILLAGE OF BLOOMFIELD 

Resolution of Support from the Village of Bloomfield 

2024 New York State Consolidated Funding Application, Water Quality 

Improvement Project 

Wastewater Treatment Plant Improvements 

 

WHEREAS, the Village Board for the Village of Bloomfield, located in Ontario County, 
supports the submission of a 2024 Consolidated Funding Application (CFA) on behalf of 
the Village, for the Water Quality Improvement Project (WQIP) program for an inflow 
and infiltration project; and 
 
WHEREAS, the New York State Department of Environmental Conservation (DEC) 
provides a competitive statewide reimbursement grant program for local governments, 
administered to directly address documented water quality impairments; and 
 
WHEREAS, an Engineering Report entitled Preliminary Engineering Report for the 
Village of Bloomfield Sewer District Flow Monitoring Study and Inflow and Infiltration 
recommends implementing the Project to help improve water quality and protect public 
health; and 
 
NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, the Village of Bloomfield Village Board 
identifies the Village Mayor as the authorized representative of the Village to execute 
necessary documents relative to and as required for the grant application; and  
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, the Village Board does hereby accept that they shall 
provide at least 25% match of the total of any grant funding awarded, as a local match 
are hereby appropriated in the form of in-kind services, cash contributions and obligated 
from the sewer fund; and 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Village Board for the Village of Bloomfield, 
located in Ontario County, recognizes and fully supports the submission of the 2024 
WQIP by MRB Group on behalf of the Village to improve water quality and protect 
public health. 
 
Motion by: Mayor Falsone, Seconded by: Trustee Falsone 
Motion Adopted: Ayes 5 (Trustee Harrington, Trustee Falsone, Trustee Didas, 
Trustee Poole, Mayor Falsone) Nays 0 
 
I, Donna Wollschleger, Village Clerk of the Village of Bloomfield, hereby certify the 
foregoing resolution to be a true and exact copy of said resolution as contained in the 
official minute’s book of said Village.  
 

 

Donna Wollschleger 

Village Clerk 

Dated 9/26/2024 

 
 
 


